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FREEDOM OF INFORMATION (FOI) REQUEST 

Thank you for your enquiry, received on 6 May 2020. 

Specifically you requested: 

This is an information request relating to overseas travel by CCC staff in the course of their 

professional duties during 2019-20. 

Please provide the following information: 

1. The dates for the trip(s).

2. The number of staff attending.

3. Cost of flights.

4. Departure and destination airport.

5. Class of travel for each passenger.

6. Airline used for each passenger.

7. Cost of hotel or similar accommodation.

8. The number of nights in the hotel or similar accommodation.

9. The number of rooms booked in the hotel or similar accommodation.

10. All miscellaneous expenses. This includes, but is not limited, hotel transfers, taxis,
public transport, meals, drinks and other stipends. 

Our response 

You subsequently clarified that the information requested related only to overseas travel 
undertaken by airplane. 

The information held is disclosed on the table in Annex A. 

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to ask for an 
internal review. If you are not content with the outcome of the review, you may apply 
directly to the Information Commissioner for a decision.  

In keeping with our transparency policy, the information released to you will be published 
on www.theccc.org.uk. Please note that this publication will not include your personal 
data. 

Kind regards, 

Committee on Climate Change

http://www.theccc.org.uk/
http://www.theccc.org.uk/
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Annex A 

Travel date Number of staff 
attending

Flight Cost Departure Airport Destination Airport Class of travel Airline Accomodation 
Cost 

Number of 
Nights

Number of 
Rooms

Miscellaneous 
Expenses

26/05/2019 1 £291.13 London Lisbon Economy  TAP Portugal 0 0 0 £30.69
04/07/2019 2 Data not held London Heathrow Belfast Economy British Airways 0 0 0 £58.50 *
07/07/2019 1 Data not held London Heathrow Auckland, New Zealand Economy Cathay Pacific Data not held 46 1 £0.00 *
27/08/2019 1 EUR 194.28 Paris Charles De Gaulle Glasgow Economy easyJet Data not held 1 1 £0.00 *
16/09/2019 1 Data not held London Heathrow Prague Economy British Airways Data not held 1 1 £0.00 *
21/10/2019 1 £193.96 London Heathrow Dublin Economy Aer Lingus 0 0 0 £37.00 *
19/11/2019 1 £1,982.88 Glasgow Beijing CN - Daxing Intl via 

London Heathrow
Economy British Airways Data not held 2 1

*
02/12/2019 1 £136.10 London Belfast Economy British Airways 0 0 0 £49.20
02/12/2019 1 £146.20 London Belfast Economy British Airways 0 0 0 £32.82

* denotes all flights and accommodation paid for by the sponsor organising the event
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